Graham, Bridget

From: Bragdon, Kenneth

Sent: Monday, August 29, 2016 9:54 AM

To: Graham, Bridget

Subject: FW: Law Department Contracts to be Extended

Hi Bridget — This is all I've got for those MAs re: a reference point for contract extensions; should be enough, right?

Ken Bragdon

Administrative Specialist

City of Austin - Purchasing Office
124 West 8t Street

Austin, TX 78701

512-974-2035 (phone)
kennethbragdon@austintexas.gov

Manager: Steve Aden, Corporate Purchasing Manager, 512-974-2002

For information about contracts and payments, please visit Austin Finance Online at:
www.austintexas.gov/finance

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail or attachments

This e-mail message may contain information that may be privileged, confidential, and exempt from disclosure. It is intended for use only by the person to whom it is addressed.
If you have received this message in error, please do not forward or use this information in any way, delete it immediately, and contact the sender as soon as possible by the
reply option or by telephone at the number listed.

From: Franklin, Tracy

Sent: Tuesday, July 26, 2016 10:17 AM

To: Bragdon, Kenneth <Kenneth.Bragdon@austintexas.gov>

Subject: Law Department Contracts to be Extended

Ken,

Will you please extend the below Law Department contracts in AIMS when you get a chance?
Thanks so much!

Tracy

Get Outlook for iOS

Effective Matter

Firm Date No Mat Ref Dep Dt
Panhandle Notes LC vs City of
Paul Hornsby & Company 12/12/2014 61264 | Austin PA150000020

Austin Fire Department - 2013
Department of Justice
French & Associates 5/6/2013 56721 | Investigation PA130000043

Bickerstaff Heath Delgado Acosta LLP 11/7/2013 58108 | Voter ID Law PA140000011
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AE Contract for IBM Billing

Greenberg Traurig 12/15/2011 52704 | System PA120000015
Linebarger Goggan Blair & Sampson, LLP 12/31/2014 62946 | Collections NR150000001
General Aviation Advice &
Counsel (General Regulatory
Foley & Lardner, Attorneys at Law 1/23/2008 39219 | Matters) PA080000023
McDonald, Sutton & DuVal, PLC 1/28/2014 58767 | Roomstore Inc. PA140000029
Mayer Brown 2/14/2013 56285 | MBE/WBE Issues PA130000055
Public Finance and Tax Related
McCall, Parkhurst & Horton, L.L.P - Dallas 3/18/2013 56382 | Airport Matters PA130000041
Austin Lifecare & Roman
Scott Douglass & McConnico, L.L.P. 3/19/2012 52565 | Catholic Diocese v COA, et al PA120000023
Thompson & Knight, L.L.P. 3/21/2013 56383 | Seaholm Redevelopment PA130000037
Thompson & Knight, L.L.P. 5/31/2002 18738 | RMMA 5020289
The Austin Bulldog v Council
Thompson & Knight, L.L.P. 4/28/2011 50708 | Members PA110000049
Greenberg Traurig 5/3/2012 53845 | Fayette Power Plant PA120000027
Bickerstaff Heath Delgado Acosta LLP 5/13/2011 50807 | Elections - Redistricting 2011 PA110000048
Reeves & Brightwell LLP 5/15/2014 59529 | Waller Creek Tunnel PA140000038
Greenberg Traurig 5/24/2012 54024 | HUD 108 Family Business Loan PA120000032
Law Offices of Ken Ramirez 5/24/2012 53700 | Water Rights PA120000030
Texas State Senate and Federal
Max Renea Hicks Attorney at Law 5/27/2011 50938 | Congressional Redistricting PA110000051
Andrews Kurth L.L.P 6/4/2013 56974 | ROCIP-General PA130000056
MA 5700
MccCall, Parkhurst & Horton, L.L.P - Dallas 6/7/2016 65328 | REIT Formation 16061600037
Clarence A. West Attorney at Law 6/11/2013 57030 | Telecommunication PA130000060
Mary K. Sahs, P.C. 5/23/2013 56786 | LCRA Water Management Plan | PA130000051
Husch Blackwell LLP 6/26/2014 59927 | ABIA Hotel PA140000046
Austin Firefighter Association v
Richards Rodriguez & Skeith 7/2/2014 59987 | COA PA140000045
Sedgwick 7/3/2014 59995 | State Highway 45 SW PA140000057
Industrial Development Corp
Greenberg Traurig 7/23/2012 54516 | (Local Government) PA120000039
New Central Library
Andrews Kurth L.L.P 7/29/2010 48226 | Construction Contract PA100000080
Larry Jackson Jr. vs City of
Richards Rodriguez & Skeith 8/2/2013 57483 | Austin [Jackson, Larry (OC-City)] | PA130000067
Greenberg Traurig 8/14/2012 54653 | Governance Utility Issues PA120000040
Lynn Ross & Gannaway, LLP 8/15/2013 57607 | Personnel Issues PA130000071
Robert Icenhauer-Ramirez 8/22/2013 57669 | Jackson, Larry (OC-Kleinert) PA130000066
David Richards 8/24/2013 58243 | ICRC PA140000008
Reeves & Brightwell LLP 9/22/2011 51991 | Central Texas 2011 Fires PA110000079
Bickerstaff Heath Delgado Acosta LLP 9/29/2014 60712 | Ethics Review Commission PA140000063
Colette Holt & Associates 10/19/2006 34990 | MBE-WBE Program - 2006 PAO70000008
Nickie Whitaker 10/26/2014 60914 | Reagan National v COA PA150000008
Van Ness Feldman LLP 11/3/2014 60949 | SH-45 (NEPA-ESA Issues) PA150000010
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Chief Craig Miller 11/7/2014 61031 | Bradley v City of Austin et al PA150000007
Denton, Navarro, Rocha Bernal Hyde & Zech,

P.C. 11/10/2010 49379 | Urban Renewal Project PA110000010
Reeves & Brightwell LLP 11/26/2012 55378 | Aigner, Ronya PA130000007
Mondrik & Associates 12/10/2008 42790 | Audit and Sales Tax Issues PA090000008
MccCall, Parkhurst & Horton, L.L.P - Dallas 12/22/2014 61322 | Whisper Valley PID PA150000016




MEMORANDUM

City of Austin
Financial & Administrative Services Department
Purchasing Office

DATE: February 12, 2014
TO: Memo to File
FROM: Lynn Rich, Buyer Il

RE: MA PA140000029

This MA was created as a payment mechanism only.

Please reference MA 5700 PA140000029 for all the original documentation, which was
created and maintained by the department.

This MA is a payment mechanism only.



City of Austin

Law Department

301 W. 2™ Street, P.O. Box 1088
Austin, Texas 78767-1088
(512) 974-2268

(512) 974-2268 (512) 974-2912
Writer’s Direct Line Writer’s Fax Line

January 28, 2014

Kevin A. Lake

McDonald, Sutton & DuVal, PLC
5516 Falmouth Street, Suite 108
Richmond, VA 23230

RE: Provide legal services regarding adversary proceeding in No. 13-03309 and
other issues regarding the Roomstore, Inc. bankruptcy, as assigned by the City
Attorney

Dear Mr. Lake:

This Engagement Letter confirms that you will represent the City of Austin to provide legal
services concerning the above-referenced matter. The City requires outside counsel to follow
certain policies outlined in the attached Terms of Engagement. Please sign and return this
Engagement Letter to Teresa Medina in the enclosed envelope, confirming that you agree to these
policies. Please include proof of professional liability insurance with minimum limits of one
million dollars ($1,000,000) per occurrence, per “Section II”’ of attached Addendum. Additionally,
you must register through the City’s Vendor Connection System at
https://www.austintexas.gov/financeonline/vendor connection/index.cfm before any invoice can
be paid.

Assistant City Attorney Teresa A. Rojo is the in-house attorney responsible for managing this matter
(the “Managing Attorney”). The City will pay for the legal services you provide, in a total amount
not to exceed $7,000.00 for all fees and expenses billed under this agreement.

We have agreed that your billing rate for this matter is $350.00 per hour. The agreed billing rates for
any other named attorney(s) and paralegal(s) authorized to work on this matter, if any, are shown on
the attached Rate Schedule. The City will not pay for work by any person not listed on the Rate
Schedule unless I preauthorize the change in writing in an amendment to the Rate Schedule.
Unless later agreed to in writing, these hourly rates are set for the duration of this engagement.

If you require consultant or subcontractor services, you must receive prior written approval from me.
Pursuant to the City's accounting and auditing policies, you must bill the City on your letterhead for
services rendered by other firms, i.e., court reporters, record companies, and consultants. The City
cannot pay invoices from other businesses if they were not hired directly by the City.



Kevin A. Lake
January 28, 2014
Page 2

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to call me or the Managing Attorney.

City Attorney

AGREED:

evin A.
McDonald, Sutton & DuVal, PLC

Attachments:  Terms of Engagement
Rate Schedule

KMK/tmm



Outside Counsel Hourly Rate Schedule and Authorized Staff

The City will only pay for work done by the staff named and at the hourly rates
listed below.

The City expects that this matter will be leanly staffed and economically handled.

Work is to be done by the person with the appropriate qualifications and an appropriate
hourly rate for the services performed.

The City expects that work on city matters will be done at hourly rates that are a
substantial discount from the firm’s general billing rates.

These hourly rates are set for the duration of the engagement.

Only the following people are authorized to work on this matter:

Kevin A. Lake Partner $350/hr

Chris McDonald Partner $350/hr
Richard Booker Associate $200/hr
Aimee L. Angell Paralegal $95/hr

Name Classification (e.g., “partner,” “associate,” “paralegal”) Hourly Rate
Agreed:

KAL— 2/ 6/ 14~

Outside Counsel Initials Dite /

Revised April 28, 2008
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MCDONM‘D, CHRISTOPHER W. McDONALD, P.C.

DANNIE R. SUTTON, JR., PC.

S U T T ON & J. Topp DUVAL, EsaQ.

KEVIN A. LAKE, P.C.

DUVAL, PLC RICHARD T. BOOKER, ESQ.*
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW *ALSO LICENSED IN MASSACHUSETTS
February 7, 2014

FEB 10 20tk
Teresa Medina LAW DEPARTMENT
City of Austin Law Department
P.O. Box 1088

Austin, Texas 78767-1088

Re:  Tavenner v. City of Austin (AP No. 13-03309-KLP)
In re RoomStore, Inc.; Bankruptcy Case No.: 13-03309-KLP

Dear Ms. Medina:

In connection with the above-captioned matter, please find enclosed the
following:

Executed Engagement Letter
Copy of my firm’s professional liability insurance declarations page
Executed W-9 Form (also uploaded via COA Vendor Connection System)

Thank you for the opportunity to represent the City of Austin in this matter.
Please contact me at the address or telephone number shown below for my Richmond
office if you have any questions or if you require anything further.

KAlL/ala
Enclosures (as stated above)

WWW.MCDONALDSUTTON.COM

A PROFESSIONAL LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY

5516 FALMOUTH STREET l VisTas II, SUITE 108 RICHMOND, VIRGINIA 23230 P: 804-843-0000 I F: 804-788-4427
3830 COURTHOUSE ROAD | PROVIDENCE FORGE, VIRGINIA 23140 P: 8B04-966-5602 I F: 8B04-968-5603
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