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CITY OF AUSTIN. TEXAS

MINUTES OF THE CITY COUNCIL
CITY OF AUSTIN, TEXAS
Regular Meeting

November 22, 1961
10:00 A.M.

Council Chamber, City Hall

The meeting was called to order with Mayor Palmer presiding.
Roll call:

Present: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Absent:  None '

Pregent also: W, T. Williams, Jr., City Manager; Doren R. Eskew, City
Attorney; Reuben Rountree, Jr., Director of Public Works; Robert A. Miles, Chief
of Folice

Invocation was delivered by FATHER PETER DAVITT, C.S.P., St. Austins
Catholic Church.

The Mayor and Council greeted and welcomed MR. CAMPBELL, Journalism
Student, University of Texas; MRS. BRADILEY FOWLER and MRS. DAN HILLIARD, Repre-
sentatives from the Junlor Ieague.

Councilman White moved that the Minutes of the Meeting of Novemher 9th,
1961, be approved. The motion, seconded by Councilman Shanks, carried by the
following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shenks, White, Mayor Paslmer
Noeg: None

Mayor Palmer introduced the following ordinance:

AN ORDINANCE ORDERING A CHANGE IN USE AND CHANGING
THE USE MAPS ACCOMPANYING CHAPTER 39 OF THE AUSTIN
CITY CODE OF 1954 AS FOLLOWS: (A) 0.60 ACRES OF

LAND, LOCALLY KNOWN AS 2001-2007 JUSTIN IANE, FROM

"A" RESIDENCE DISTRICT TO "O" OFFICE DISTRICT;

(B) 2.22 ACRES OF LAND, LOCALLY KWOWN AS 6613-6803
BURNET LANE, FROM "A" RESIDENCE DISTRICT TO "C*
COMMERCIAL DISTRICT; AND (C) 3.82 ACRES OF LAND,
LOCALLY KNOWN AS 6805-6847 BURNET LANE AND 2009-2209
JUSTIN LANE, FROM "A" RESIDENCE DISTRICT TO "IR" LOCAL
RETATL DISTRICT; ALL OF SAID PROPERTY BEING LOCATED IN
AUSTIN, TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS; AND SUSFENDING THE RULE
REQUIRING THE READING OF ORDINANCES ON THREE SEPARATE
DAYS.
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The ordinance was read the first time and Councilmsn White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its second reading. The
motion, seconded by Councilman Shanks, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Cowncilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanke, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The ordinsnce was read the second time and Councilmen White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its third reading. The motion,
seconded by Councilman Shanks, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: TNone

The ordinance was read the third time and Councilman White moved that
the ordinasnce be finally passed. The motion, seconded by Councilman Shanks,
carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Anﬁstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The Mayor smmounced that the ordinance had been finally passed.

Mayor Palmer introduced the following ordinance:

AN ORDINANCE ORDERING A CHANGE IN USE AND CHANGING
THE USE MAPS ACCOMPANYING CHAPTER 39 OF THE AUSTIN
CITY CODE OF 1954 AS FOLIOWS: LOTS 8 AND 9, DIXIE
TERRACE, LOCALLY XNOWN AS 8333-8341 BURNET ROAD AND
2307-2315 DORIS DRIVE, FROM "C" COMMERCIAL DISTRICT
TO "C-1" COMMERCIAL DISTRICT; AND SUSPENDING THE
RULE REQUIRING THE READING OF ORDINANCES ON THREE
SEPARATE DAYS,

The ordinsnce was read the first time and Councilman Shanks moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its second reading. The
motion, seconded by Councilman White, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The ordinance was read the second time and Councilman Shanks moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its third reading. The motion,
seconded by Councilmen White, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shenks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The ordinsnce was read the third time and Councilman Shanks moved that
the ordinsnce be finally passed. The motion, seconded by Councilmen White,
carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: MNone

The Mayor announced that the ordinance had been finally passed.
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MAYOR PAIMER smmounced that at 9:30, a proclamstion was signed declaring
SATURDAY as AUSTTIN MARQON DAY, and the City wishes the Maroons well in their
geme with RAY HIGH SCHOOL, Corpus Christi. _

The City Mensger submitted the following:

"CITY OF AUSTIN BIDS FOR CHEMICALS - FILTER PLANTS

Sodium Hexametaphosphate, Alternate by
per City Specifications truck:

Quantity 60,0004 car 60, 000#
McKesson Robbins $7,311.00 $7,%16.00
Mineral Products Div.Food Mach.Co. 75 320.60 No Bid
Nalco T5320.00 T,T40.00
Olin Chemical Company T,321.00 7,746.00
Dixie Chemical Compsny 7, 464,00 No Bid
Thompson«Hayward Chem.Co. T,320.00 No Bid
Maintensnce Engineering Compeny 7,152.00 No Bid
Dearborn Chemical Co. 7,158.00 No Bid

low bid May 25,196) Dixie Chem.Co.(Rail) 7,464.00

"Sodium Hexametaphosphate is used in treatment of water at Filter FPlant. This
is spproximately & six months supply. ILast Order piaced in May 1961. This
product was formerly produced under the patented trade name of "CALGON" and
could be bid only by license. The patent expired in September of this year «
hence more competition and betier price. Bids were sent to all in this area
who could bid., Only firm not bidding was R. M. Hughes, Austin, who stated he
would not be competitive in quantities that large.

"RECOMMENDATION: Recommend contract be awarded Maintenance Engineering Company
for one 60,000 1b. car lomd by rail as lowest and best bid at a total price of
$7,152.00.

"W. T. Williams, Jr. City Manager"

Councilman White offered the following resolution and moved its adoption:
{RESOLUTION)

WHEREAS, bids were recelived by the City of Austin on November 16, 1961
for a 60,000 pound carload of Sedium Hexametsphosphate, per City specifications,
which amount is approximately a six months supply; and,

WHEREAS, the bid of Maintenence Engineering Compsny in the sum of
$7,152.00 was the powest and best bid therefor, and the acceptance of such bid
has been recommended by the Purchasing Agent of the City of Austin and by the
City Mansger; Now, Therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

That the bid of Maintenance Engineering Company in the sum of $7,152.00
be and the same is hereby accepted and W. T. Willjiams, Jr., City Mansger of the
City of Austin, be and he is hereby authorized to execute a contract on behalf
of the City with Maintenance Engineering Company.
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The motion, seconded by Councilman Perry, carried by the following vobte:
Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: HNone

Mayor Palmer introduced the following ordinance:

AN CRDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO ENTER
INTO A CERTAIN CONTRACT WITE AUSTIN DEVELOPMENT
COMPANY, LTD.; FROVIDING FOR THE APPROFRTATION OF
MONEY PAID TO THE CITY OF AUSTIN UNDER SUCH CONTRACT;
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

The ordinance was read the first time and Councilman White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its second reading. The
motion, seconded by Councilman Shanks, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Ammstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The ordinance was read the second time and Councilman White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to 1ts third reading. The motion,
seconded by Councilman Shanks, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: RKRone

The ordinance was read the third time snd Councilmen White moved that
the opdinance be finally passed. The motion, seconded by Councilmen Shenks,
carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Hoes: None

The Mayor snnounced that the ordinance had been finally passed.

Mayor Palmer introduced the following ordinance:

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO ENTER

INTO A CERTAIN CONTRACT WITH AUSTEX DEVELOPMENT CO.,
L1D. AND NASH PHILLIIPS-COPUS; PROVIDING FOR THE APFRO-
PRIATION OF MONEY PAID TO THE CITY OF AUSTIN UNDER SUCH
CONTRACT; AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

The ordinance was read the first time and Councilmsn White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its second reading. The
motion, seconded by Councilmen Shenks, carried by the following vote:

Aves: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None '

The ordinance was read the second time and Councilman White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to itg third reading. The motion,
gseconded by Councilman Shanks, carried by the following vote:
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Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The Srdinance was read the third time and Councilman White moved that
the ordinsnce he finally passed. The motion, seconded hy Councilman Shanks,
carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The Mayor ennounced thet the ordinance had been finelly passed.

Councilman White offered the following resolution and moved its adoption:
{RESOLUTION)
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

THAT the City Coumnecil of the City of Austin hereby approves the property
situated on the west side of Goodrich Avenue as a private gasoline plant con-
sisting of a (1) 1,000 gallon tank and (1) electric gasoline pump for the sole
purpose of servicing their own motor equipment, and from which no gasoline is
to be sold, which property is owned by K. 8. Wendler Construction Company, and
is Iot 3, of the Mary B. Harper Addition, of the City of Austin, Travis County,
Texas, and hereby authorizes the seid K. 5. Wendler Construction Company to
operate a private gasoline plant consisting of a (1) 1,000 gallon tank and (1)
electric gasoline pump for the sole purpose of servicing their own motor equip-
ment, and from which no gasoline is to be sold, subject to the same being
operated in compliance with all the ordinences relating thereto, and further
subject to the foregovipg attached recommendations; and the Building Inspector
is hereby suthorized to issue an occupancy permit for the operation of this
private gasoline plant after full complience with all the provisions of this
resolution, and said permission shall be held to be granted, and accepted sub~
Ject to all necessary, reasonable and proper, present and future regulations
and ordinsnces of the City of Austin, Texes, in the enforcement of the proper
police, traffic snd fire regulations; and the right of revocation is retained
if, after hearing, it is found by the City Council that the said K. S. Wendler
Construction Company has failed and refused, and will continue to fall and
refuse to perform any such conditions, regulations and ordinances.

{Recommendations attached)
"Austin, Texas
November 21, 1961

"Mr. W. T. Williams, Jr.
City Manager
Austin, Texas

“"Dear Sir:
"I, the undersigned, have congidered the application of K. 8. Wendler Construc-

tion Company, by their agent, Horace 8. Wallace, Jr., for permission to operate
a private gasoline plant consisting of a (1) 1,000 gallon underground tank and
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{1) electric gasoline pump for the sole purpose of servicing their own motor
equipment and from which no gasoline is to be sold, upon property located on
the west side of Goodrich Avenue, which property is designated as Lot 3, of
the Mary B. Harper Addition in the City of Austin, Travis County, Texas, and
locally mown as 2130 Goodrich Avenue.

"This property is located in a "C" Commercial District and I recommend that
this permit be grented subject to the following conditions:

"(1) That the gasoline tanks and pumps shall be of an approved type and shall
bear the label of the Underwriters laboraiories, Inc., and that ali tanks and
pumps shall be installed in compliance with the Ordinance governing the storage
and handiing of gasoline.

"(2) That all tenks and pumps shall be located not nearer than 10 feet to the
property line and so located that cars stopped for the purpose of unloading or
receiving gasoline or other supplies shall not in any way obstruct the free
passage of traffic on either the sidewslk, street, or alley.

"{3) That "NO SMOKING" signs shall at all times be prominently displayed and
no person shall be permitted to smoke on the premises where gasoline is handled
or stored.

"(4) That all fees shall be paid and a permit secured from the Building
Inspector!'s Office before any installation work is started, and that no equip-
ment shall be placed in operation until after final inspection and spproval of
same . :

"Respectfully submitted,

s/ Dick T. Fordan

Building Inspector"

The motion, seconded by Councilman Armstrong, carried by the following
vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer

Noes: HNone

Comncilman Armstrong offered the following resolution and moved its
adoption:

{RESOLUTION)

WHEREAS, under date of September 29, 1960, the City Council of the City
of Austin passed and adopted Ordinance No. 600929-H, vacating 9,453 square feet
of West 22nd Street in the City of Austin, Travis County, Texas, and in such
Ordinance retained an easement for public utilities and drainage purposes; said
street being out of and s part of Shoal Creek Bouleverd Iots, a subdivision of
record in Book 3 at page 218 of the Plat Records of Travis County, Texas; and

WHEREAS, the owners of the above described property have requested the
City Council of the City of Austin to release all of the north portion of the
public utility and drainage eesement retained in said Ordinance, save and except
a strip of land ten (10.00) feet in width adjacent and parallel to the centerline
of said West 22nd Street as vacated; and all of the south portion of the public
utility and drainage easement retained in said Ordinance, save and except a
strip of land fifteen (15.00) feet in width adjacent and parsllel to the center-
line of said West 22nd Street as vacated; and,
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WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that said portioms of said
easement, in, upon and across the sbove described property, is not now needed
and will not be required in the future; Now, Therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CLTY OF AUSTIN:

That W. T. Williams, Jr., City Manager, be and he is hereby authorized
to execute a relesse of the following described easement for public utility end
drainage purposes, to-wit:

Two (2) tracts of land hereinafter described as
Tract 1 and Tract 2 out of and a part of that certain
street in the City of Austin, Travis County, Texas
known as West 22nd Street, sald street being out of
and 2 part of Shoal Creek Boulevard Lots, a subdivi-
sion of record in Book 3 at page 218 of the Plat
Records of Travis County, Texas, each of the said
two (2) tracts of land being out of that portion of
West 22nd Street vacated by City Ordinance No.
600929-H deted September 29, 1960 and being more
particularly described as follows:

NO. 1 REING all of the north portion of the public utility and drainage
easement retained by said City Ordinance No. 600929-H save and except a strip of
land ten (10.00) feet in width adjacent end parallel to the centerline of sald
West 22nd Street as vacated.

NO. 2 BEING all of the south portion of the public utility and drainage
easement retained by said City Ordinance No. 600929-1 save and except a strip of
land fifteen (15.00) feet in width adjacent and parallel to the centerline of
said West 22nd Street as vacated.

The motion, Seconded by Councilmen Perry, carried by the following vote:
Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noeg: None

Councilman Perry moved that the Council accept the withdrawal of the
following zoning espplication at the request of the spplicant:

R. GRAHAM WILSON 3410 West Avenue From "A" Residence
‘ To "BB" Residence

The motion, seconded by Councillman Shanks, csrried by the following vote:
Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The City Menager made s report on a reguest of MR. JOHN COATS, to have
BRIDLE PATH from Scenic Drive easterly to the alley vacated, stating at the tire
the request was made, it was thought it would not be appropriate to vacate the
gtreet. The street is now on the list of projects to be paved. The property
owners have petitioned the City to pave the portion of the street which was in-
volved in the vacation request, and the matter of abandoning the street has never
been disposed of. The Planning Commission and ell of the Departments concerned
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had recommended against closing the street. Councilman White moved that the
request to vacate Bridle Path be denied. The motion seconded by Counciiman
Shanks, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councllmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noeg: None

Mayor Pelmer asked that the petitioner be notified that the Council had
found it necessary to retain the street. ILater in the meeting the City Attorney
reported there were some improvements in the right-of-way of Bridle Path, and
discussed the letiter he was writing to the property owner regarding the removal
of the encroachments only necessary to complete the paving, and that the property
1 owner was not obtaining a permit to recongtruct sny improvements in the right-of-
way. The Mayor stated this expression was agreeable to the Council.

MAYOR PAIMER resad a letter from CHIEF DICKERSON stating Friday, November
24, 1:00 P.M. the Austin Fire Department would conduct an acceptance test on
four fire engines and one ladder truck, at the Firemen's tower, and inviting the
Council to attend. The Mayor stated this was the finest and iatest in fire fight-
ing equipment, and the Council was real proud of them. Councilman Armstrong made
a report on the purchase of this specially sized equipment by Jjoining with the
state in purchases on volume, whereby a concession was made for the volume. He
pointed out the savings on the chassis that were passed on by the Ford people and
equipment people to the City. The Council set 2:00 P.M. Friday November 2h, to
abtend this fire demonstration.

The Council discussed whether or not a “key to the city" should be given
to dignitarieswisiting Austin. It was the general opinion of the Council that
the City should not go into this program,

MR. TOM DUNLOP, on behalf of the Texas Safety Assoclation, invited the
members of the Council, officials of the City, and the public in general to
attend the Traffiec Safety Conference, L.C.R.A. Auditorium, on November 29th,
T7:00 P.M. The Mayor stated he and the Council would make every effort to join
in with the group.

Councilman Shanks stated MR. MAC HULL read s letter to him stating the
Council had granted him permission to use the property used last year for the
sale of Christmas trees sgain thls year. This was granted on August 3lst. The
Mayor asked that Mr. Hull be requested to operate the lot quietly, to turn off
the lights at 10:00 P.M. and to keep the premises clean, as there had been many
complaints from the neighbors.

COUNCIIMAN ARMSTRONG suggested that the Police Department defer purchas
ing its automobiles until later, as he believed quite a savings could be realized
by waiting.
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The City Menager stated on April 13th, 1961, the Council approved a plan
for the 40 Acres Club for off-street parking subject to the rearrangement of the
parking to provide better means of ingress and egress. He submitted the revised
plang, which he sald he was recommending to the Council for approval. The Direc-
tor of Public Works explained the off-street parking pattern as submitted by the
Architects. Councilmsn Shanks moved that the plans for 30 spaces as submitted
and recoumended by the City Manager be approved. The motion, seconded by Council-
man White, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: DNone
Wot in Council Room when the roll was called: Councilman Perry

The City Manager called attention to the flling of the Status of Water
and Sanitary Sewer Contract Projects as of November 1, 1961. The Mayor suggested
having some afternoon meetings to go into the details of these reportis.

Pursuant to published notice thereof the following zoning applications
were publicly heard:

BAICONES BUILDING COR- 1923 & 3301 No.Lemar Blvd. From "BB" Residence
PORATION, By Dan Priest Additional Area To "O" Office
1921 No. lLamar Boulevard RECOMMENDED by the
Planning Commission

No opposition appeared. Councilmsn Perry moved that the change to "O"
Office he granted. The motion, seconded by Councilman White, carried by the
following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noee: XNone

The Mayor emnounced that the change had been granted to "0" Office and
the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary ordinance to cover.

- e m my A e e

MRS. ELIZARETH McINTYRE 2701L-05 Oldham Street From "A" Residence
By Betty lane 802-04 Wahrenberger 1st Height & Ares
To "B" Residence 2nd
Height & Aresa

RECOMMENDED by the
Planning Commission

No opposition appeared. Councilman Armstrong moved that the change to
"B" Residence 2nd Height and Area be granted. The motion, seconded by Councilman
Perry, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The Mayor ammounced that the chsnge had been granted to "B" Residence 2nd
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Height and Ares and the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary
ordinance to cover.

WARREN E. HAWKINS, 100-112 Post Road Dr. From "A" Residence
By HNelson Puett & 3720~3726 So.Congress To "C" Commercial
Associates RECOMMENDED by the

Planning Commission

No opposition appeared. Councilman White moved that the change to "¢"
Commercial be granted. The motion, seconded by Councilman Perry, cartied by the
following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The Mayor announced that the change had been granted to "C" Commercial
and the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary ordinance to cover.

- e o e e ow w a

CITY PLANNING T07-711 West 3Bth Street From "A" Residence
COMMISSION To "O" Office

RECOMMENDED by the
Plapning Commission

No opposition appeared. Councilmsn Perry moved that the change to "O"
Office be granted. The motion, seconded by Councilmsn White, carried by the
following vote:

Ayes: Counciilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Magyor Palmer
Noes: None

The Mayor announced that the change had been granted to "0" Office and
the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary ordinance to cover.

JACK MASON, et al 142141503 (1507-1511) From "A" Residence

By Andrew H. Vigcardi 014 Austin-Del Valle Rd. To "C" Commercial
& 1400-1h450 State NOT Recommended by the
Highway Tl Flanning Commigsion

RECCMMENDED "GR"
General Retall

No opposition appeared. Councilmen Shanks moved that the change to "GR"
Genersl Retail be granted as recommended by the Flan Commission. The motion,
seconded by Councilmen White, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: YNone
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The Mgyor snnounced that the change had been granted to "GR" General
Retail and the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary ordinance to
cover.

- e em s s e Me m

ARTURO RAMIREZ 501 Bast 1b4th Street From "B" Residence 2nd
1307-11 Neches Street Height & Area
To "C~1l" Commercial 2ng
Helght and Area
NOT Recommended by the
Planning Commission
RECOMMENDED "C"
Commercial

No opposition appeared. Councilmen White moved that the change to "C"

Commercisl be granted as recommended by the Plan Commission. The motion, secondeq
by Councilman Perry, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Bhanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

The Mayor amnounced that the change had been granted to "C" Commercial
and the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary ordinance to cover.

- e e o o e

TEXAS & NEW ORLEANS Rear of 4201-05 Inter- From "A" Residence 5th
RATIROAD COMPANY regional Highway Height & Area
By Fred J. Ribar To "C" Commercisl 5th

Height & Area
NOT Recommended by the
Flanning Commission

No opposition appeared. Mrs. Fred Ribar Appeared in behalf of the zoning
request, and stated cars coming down the Interregional 4id not see their motel
until it was too late to turn into thelr place. Mr. Hodge from the Railrosd
Company was present in the interest of the change. Councilman Shanks moved
that the change to "C" Commercial 5th Height and Area be granted. The motion,
seconded by Councilman White, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: RHNone

The Mayor announced that the change had been granted to "C" Commercial 5th

Height and Area and the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary
ordinance to cover.
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H. D. MOTSENBOCKER 1302-04 Egst 52nd Street From "A" Residence

By Cy Miller To "B" Residence
NOT Recommended by the
Flamning Commission
RECOMMENDED “BB"
Residence

Mo opposition appeared. Mr. Miller wanted the "B" classification as
applied for, but not recommended by the Planning Commission. It was pointed
out two other gpplications had been either denied or withdrswn and resubtmitted
for "BB" Regidence lst Height and Ares. The Director of Planning said the
Commission did not feel it was in a position to grant these lots, which would
create a greater density than those denied in the same area. It was pointed
out that a street set aside for apartments should have 60! right-of-way and LO!
paving, and this street is only 50' width and 30' paving, Councilman Perry
moved to grant the zoning as "BB" Residence lst Height and Ares as recommended.
The motion, seconded by Councilman Shanks, carried by the followlng vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Avymstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None ‘

The Mayor announced that the change had been granted to "BB" Residence
gnd the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary ordinance to cover.

MRS, A. R. WOODALL,Owner T1i7-~719 Montopolis Drive From "A" Residence

FLOYD 1. JOHBNSON, To "C" Commercial

Purchaser NOT Recommended by the
Planning Comnission
RECOMMENDED "GR"
General Retail

No opposition appeared. Councilman White moved that the change to "GR"
General Retail be granted. The motion, seconded by Councilman Perry, carried
by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noeg: MNone

The Mayor amnnounced that the change had been granted to "GR" Seneral
Retail and the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary ordinance to
cover.

- am o ws W o e -

C. E. MOYER 5102 Caswell Avenue From “"A" Residence
To "B" Residence
NOT Recommended by the
Planning Commission

Councilman Perry moved that the applicant be given permission to withdraw
the zoning request, if he so desires. The wmotion, seconded by Councilman White,
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carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None

T. HARDIE BOWMAN & 1409-1411 Cotton Street From "A" Residence
ROBERT H. BOWMAN To "B" Residence lst
Height & Area

WOT Recommended by the
Planning Commission

MR. ROBERT SNEED represented the applicant, and amended the reguest to
be "B" Residence lst Height and Area instead of 2nd Height and Area, and this
would permit the erection of seven apartments rather than nine. The property
noy has four hutments. He stated the Planning Commission had denied this re-
quest (1) The property is located within the area proposed for Urban Renewal,
the Kealing project; and (2) It would be spot zoning. BHe pointed out the
haphazard zoning of the area, and filed pictures of the property. He said his
clients were trying to do for this property what Urban Renewal would do for the
entire area. He showed the Architects plans for the apartment house, and pointed
out there were nine off-street parking spaces. He stated there was a need for
this type of development. The units would probably rent for $40.00. Opposition
wag expressed by MR. CALHOUN, 1408 Cotton, and Principal of Kealing Junior High
Sehool, stating the neighbors wanted to keep this area for home living, and did
not want the zoning dropped to "B"; and if one "B" were granted, the whole area
could be changed to "B", which was not the plan as set up under Urban Renewal.
The Director of Planming explained the status of the property under the Urban
Renewal project. The Mayor stated the Council would go look at the property.

R I A .

JOE JOSEPH 1621 West 6th Street From "B" Residence 2nd
By Lindy L. Boyd 507-511 Campbell Street Helght & Area
To "O" Office 2nd
Height and Ares
¥OT Recommended by the
Planning Commission

Mrs. Boyd represented the applicahd stating she operated a nursery here,
and it waas at her reguest, not Mr. Joseph's, that The change of zoning be
granted, so that she can operate the nursery without bhaving to live on the
premises. She stated this was an ideal location for a nursery, and there was--cer;
tainly a need, She read letters from the State Department of Public Welfare,
Home of the Holy Infancy, from seversl of her customers, all letters commending
the operation of the nursery, and pointing the need. Opposition was expressed
by MR. HOMER S. JOMSON, not for the nursery, but for the spot zone, stating a
change of zoning would grant her permission to have an uwnlimited number of
children in her nursery, and the neighbors wanted to protect their investments
in their homes. The Director of Planning discussed this area as to its present
development and the changes that might occur when the Missouri-Pacific Boulevard
goes in, stating some very detailed plsmning will be necessary. The Mayor stated
the Council would make = personal ingpection of the area.
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Councilman Armstrong offered the following resolubtion and moved its
adoption:

{RESOLUTION)

WHEREAS, by instrument dated September 13, 1918 of record in Volume 305
at page 92 of the Deed Records of Travis County, Texas, a sanitary sewer ease-
ment was granted, same belng out of and & part of Brinwood Section 2, a pro-
posed subdivision of a portion of the Isaac Decker ILeague in the City of Austin,
Travis Counby, Texas; and

WHEREAS, the owners of said premises have requested the City Council of
the City of Austin to release all of the said sanitary sewer easement which lies
between the South line and North line of Brinwood Section 2; and,

WHEREAS, the City Council has determined that said portion of said ease-
ment, in, upon and across the above described property is not now needed and
will not be required in the future; Now, Therefore,

BE IT RESOIVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

That W. T. Williams, Jr., City Menager, be and he is hereby authorized
to execute a releage of the following described easement for saultary sewer
purposes, to-wit:

Being all of that certain strip of land which lies between the
south line of Brinwood Section 2, a proposed subdivision of a
portion of the Isaac Decker league in the City of Austin, Travis
County, Texas, and the north line of the said Brinwood Section 2,
salid strip of land is to be released from the sanitary sewer
easement provided for by instrument dated September 13, 1918

of record in Volume 3065 at page 92 of the Deed Records of Travis
County, Texas.

The motion, seconded by Councilman White, carried by the following vote:
Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, White, Mayor Palmer
Noes: DNone

The Council recessed at 12:45.

RECESSED MEETING 3:00 P.M.
The Council resumed its business al 2:00 P.M,

The Assistant City Manager submitted a report on the operation of the
four Cemeteries, Oskwood Cemetery, Oakwood Annex, Evergreen Cemetery, and Memorial
Park, and submitted three recommendations:

1. That the disinterments to any private cemetery be discontinued.

2. To ralse the charge on Sundays and the nine City recognized
holidays from $35.00 to $70.00

3. To raise the charge for interment from $35.00 to $45.00.

MR. JIM WILSON, read a letter from MR. ALBERT L. LANGE, menager, Capital Memorial
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Gardens, suggesting certain hours of working days for grave opening and closing,
and prices; and for prices for funerals held on Sundays and legal holidays. He
read letters from RESTLAND OF DALLAS; SUNSET MEMORIAL PARK, Taylor, FOREST PARK
CEMETERY, Houston, stating generally that funerals were not held on Sundays in
those cities; but if there were special requests, extra charges were made.
COUNCIIMAN WHITE had to leave the Council meeting at this time. The Counecil had
8 detailed discussion on the recommendations and the costs of the operation of
the Cemeteries, Councilman Shanks moved that the charge for interments be raised
from $35.00 to $50.00; that the cherge for interments on SUNDAYS be raised from
$35.00 to $75.00; that the City discontinue interments by city forces in prie
vately operated cemeteries; and that the selling price of cemetery lots be raised
gn estimated 10% rounded off to the nearest highest $5.00, the lot selling price
to become effective immediately, and the other charges to become effective Janue
ary 1, 1962. The motion, seconded by Councilmsn Perry, carried by the following
vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Armstrong, Perry, Shanks, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None
Absent: Councilman White

The City Attorney discussed & situation that pertained to the opening of
East 12th Sitreet through to the east side loop, if it ever is to be extended in
accordaner with the Austin Development Plan. The Bethany Christian Church had
begun a construction prior to the approval of the Develomment Flan. It now wants
to put brick veneer on the bullding. The City Attorney explained possible land
purchases and exchanges whereas the Church could relocate its building to some
adjoining lots. He listed the cost of relocating these bulldings to be around
$6,500~$7,500. He pointed out on a map two triangles of land the City owned in
the area and explained how these properties could be involved in the transactions.
After discussing the City Attorney!'s recommendation thoroughly, Councilman Perry
moved that the Council approve the recommendation of the ILegal Department on
this matter. (12th and Webberville Road) The motion, seconded by Councilman
Shanks, carried by the following wvote:

Ayes: Councllmen Perry, Shanks, Mayor Palmer
Noes: None
Abgent: Councilmen Amstrong, White

The City Manager apnounced that the Hospital Board had reset the meeting
with DR. CARL J. TRIPCLI from November 2hth until the next Board meeting.

Thé Counclil received notice from the City Manager that {the following
zoning applications had been referred to the Flan Commission and set for public
hearing before the Council for January 4, 1962:

BILI FARMER 5610 Jim Hogg From "A" Residence
By M.L. Mansfield To "B" Residence

MRS. R, B. CARRINGTON  407~-409 East 12th Street From "B" Residence 2nd
By Allwyn G. Gannaway 1106-1110 Neches Street Height & Aresa
To "C" Commercigl 3rd
Height & Ares




I & M BUILLDERS
By logan Melton

W. H. BULLARD

BULLARD COMPANY
By W. H. Bullard

JACK ANDREWARTHA
By Phill Mockford

ALFONSO H. LOPEZ

ROBERT T. McALLISTER
By Hugh D. Sullivan

CHARILES T. BROWN

P. E. WORSHAM

THOMAS BIACK, Trustee
By Arthur G. Stell

JAMES E. EICHELBERGER

R. G. LEMMONS
By E4d M. Horme

MRS. LALLAGE J.
EGLESTON

GRAY M, BIANDY
By Charles Granger

CLTY OF AUSTIN, TEXAS

1205

1100-1106 East 32nd Street From "A" Residence 5%

3201.-3203 East Avenue

2808-2816 White Rock Dr.
6101.-6129 Bullard Drive

3807~-3811 Kennelwood
Road
19131 Dewvid Street

2500 Hidalgo Street
621623 Pedernalas St.

1900-1902 Tillotson Ave.
1121-13123 Chicon Street

96 East Avenue
TO9-TL3 Driskill Street

1120 East 52nd Street

300-306 East 15th Street
1501~1509 San Jacinto St.

2106-2108 Oldham Street
TOT-T11 Manor Rosd

5209-5215 Joe Sayers Ave.

1149E-1151F Nichols Ave.

500-502 Bellevue Flace
300L=~3007 Duval Street
501~03 Rathervue Place

- To "C-1" Commercial

‘Mo "B" Residence

Height & Area 1
To "B" Residence 5th
Height & Ares

From Interim "A"
Residence
To "B" Residence

From "A" Residence
To "B" Residence

From "A" Residence
To "BB" Residence

From "D" Industrial
2rd Height & Ares

3rd Height & Ares

From "C" Commercial
To "C-1" Commercial

From "A" Residence
To "C-2" Commercial

From "B" Residence
To "Q" Office

From "C~l" Commercial
2nd Height & Area

To "C~-2" Commercial
Znd Height & Area

From "BB" Residence
2nd Helght & Area
To "B" Residence
Znd Height & Ares

From "A" Residence
1st Height & Ares
To "B" Residence
2nd Height & Ares

From "A" Residence

From "A" Residence
lst Heighlt & Ares
To "B" Residence
2nd Height & Ares
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1206

E. WORSHAM 6000-6006 Interregional
Highway
6007-6011 Brooks Street

PHILLIP & ERNEST 601~605 Peacock (Oakcrest)
JOSEPH 3016-3022 South lst Street
By Robert J. Pobts

From "C" Commercisl
6th Height & Ares

To “C-1" Commercial
6th Height & Area

From "A" Residence
To "C~1" Commercial

There being no further business, the Council adjourned at 4:45 P.M.,

svubject to the call of the Mayor.
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Mayor

ATTEST:
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City Clerk




