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MINUTES OF THE CITY COUNCIL
CITY OF AUSTIN, TEXAS
Regular Meeting

November 17, 1955
10:00 AM.

Council Chamber, City Hall

The meeting was called to order with Mayor Miller presiding.
Roll Call:

Present: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Absent: None

Present also: W. T. Williams, Jr., City Manager; Doren R. Egkew, City
Attorney; 8. Reuben Rountree, Jr,, Director of Public Works.

Invocation was delivered by REV., WILLIAM C. BIRKNER, St. John's Methodist
Church, 2140 Allendale Road.

Councilman White moved that the Minutes of November 10, 1955, be approved.
The motion, seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Counclilmen Tong, Palmer, Pearsom, White, Mayor Miller
Noes:  None

The Mayor recognized nine Police Recruits atiending the Council Meeting
and commended the Police Depertment on the fire job it is doing.

MR: W. O. MITTAG, spokesman for & group, requested that the water line
being laid on Sprimgdale Road be extended 3000 feet so as to include 16 houses
on Pecan Springs Road. He siated this property had been annexed in 1951 and
they would like to have this water line to have fire protection and betbter
Tire rates. Mr. Davis, Water Superintendent, explained the situation and stated
that if this line wes extended they would not have betiter fire protection but
they would have better pressure as soon &8 1t 1s completed, The group was told
this would be checked and see what could be done and they would be given an
answer within a week,
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The Council had before it the following zoning application deferred from
last week:

BAPTIST FOUNDATION OF = 501-503 Elmwood Place From "B" Residence

TEXAS 2803 San Jacinto Blvd, To "LR"™ Local Retail
Not Recommended by the
Planning Commission.
Recormended "O" Office

) The Mayor asked those who wished to grant the change to "OY Office to
vote "aye"; those opposed to vote "no". Roll call showed the following:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Meyor Miller
Neoes: None

The Mayor ennounced that the change had been granted to "O" Office Dis-
trict and the City Attorney was instructed to draw the necessary ordinance to
cover,

Meydr Miller introduced the following ordinance:

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THAT CERTAIN ORDINANCE PASSED

BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIY, TEXAS,

JULY 17, 1941, AND RECORDED IN ORDINANCE BOOK "L",
PAGES 152-1Th, INCLUSIVE, OF THE ORDINANCE RECORDS

OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN, WHICH ORDINANCE WAS AMENDATORY
OF THAT CERTAIN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING ZONING REGULA-
TIONS AND DISTRICTS IN ACCORDANCE WITH A COMPREHENSIVE
PLAN PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL, APRIL 23, 1931, AND
RECORDED IN BO®K "I", PAGES 301-318, INCLUSIVE, OF THE
ORDINANCE RECORDS OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN, THE AMENDATORY
ORDINANCE HEREBY CHANGING THE USE AND HEIGHT AND ARFA
DESIGNATIONS ON BLOCKS 57, 47, 46, 45 AND NORTH ONE-HALF
‘OF bk, CHRISTIAN'AND FELIMAN'S SURDIVISION IN THE CITY
OF AUSTIN, TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS; ORDERING A CHANGE IN
I'HE USE AND HEIGHT AND AREA MAPS SO AS T0 RECORD THE
CHANGES HEREBY ORDERED; AND SUSPENDING THE RULE REQUIR-
ING THE READING OF ORDINANCES ON THREE SEPARATE DAYS.

The ordinence was read the first time and Councilman White moved that the
rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its second reading. The motion,
seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

The ordinance was read the second time and Councilman White moved that the
rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its third reading. The Hotion,
seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noeg: None

The ordinance was read the third time and Councilman White moved ‘that the
ordinance be finally passed. The motion, seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried
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by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

The Meyor anncunced that the ordinance had been finally passed.

Meyor Miller introduced the following ordinance;

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THAT CERTAIN ORDINANCE PASSED

BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN, TEXAS,

JULY 17, 1941, AND RECORDED IN ORDINANCE BOOK “L",
PAGES 152-17k, INCLUSIVE, OF THE ORDINANCE RECORDS

OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN, WHICH ORDINANCE WAS AMENDATORY
OF THAT CERTAIN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING ZONING REGUILA-
TIONS AND DISTRICTS IN ACCORDANCE WITH A COMPREHENSIVE
PLAN PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL, APRIL 23, 1931, AND
RECORDED IN BOOK "I", PAGES 301-318, INCIUSIVE, OF THE
ORDINANCE RECORDS OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN, THE AMENDATORY
ORDINANCE HEREBY CHANGING THE USE DESIGNATION FROM "B"
RESIDENCE DISTRICT AND SECOND HEIGHT AND AREA DISTRICT
TO "O" OFFICE DISTRICT AND SECOND HEIGHT AND AREA DIS-
TRICT ON TWO TRACTS OF IAND LOCALLY KNOWN AS 1120-22
WEST 19TH STREET, 1901-23 IAMAR BOULEVARD, AND 112428,
1112-18 WEST 19TH STREET IN THE CITY OF AUSTIN, TRAVIS
COUNTY, TEXAS; ORDERING A CHANGE IN THE USE MAPS SO AS
TO RECORD THE CHANGE HEREEY ORDERED; AND SUSPENDING
THE RULE REGUIRING THE READING OF ORDINANCES ON THREE
SEPARATE DAYS.

The ordinance was read the first time and Councilman White moved that the
rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its second reading. The motion,
seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

The ordinance was read the second time and Councilmen White moved that the
rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its third reading. The motion,
seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried by the following vote:

Ayeg: Councilmen Iong, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None ' ’ ‘

The ordinance was read the third time and Councilman White moved that the
ordinance be finally passed. The motion, seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried
by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

The Mayor announced that the ordinance hed been finally passed.
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Mayor Miller introduced the follewing ordinance:

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THAT CERTAIN ORDINANCE PASSED

BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN, TEXAS,

JULY 17, 1941, AND RECORBED IN ORDINANCE BOOK "L",
PAGES 152-1T4, INCLUSIVE, OF THE ORDINANCE RECORDS

OF THE CI¥Y OF AUSTIN, WHICH ORDINANCE WAS AMENDATORY
OF THAT CERTAIN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING ZONING REGUILA-
TIONS AND DISTRICTS IN ACCORDANCE WITH A CCMPREHENSIVE
PLAN PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL, APRIL 23, 1931, AND
RECORDED IN BOOK “"I", PAGES 301-318, INCLUSIVE, OF THE
ORDINANCE RECORDS OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN, THE AMENDATORY
ORDINANCE HEREBY CHANGING THE USE DESIGNATION FROM "A"
RESIDENCE DISTRICT AND FIRST HEIGHT AND AREA DISTRICT
TO "C" COMMERCIAL, FIRST HEICGHT AND AREA DISTRICT ON
THREE TRACTS OF LAND LOCALLY KNOWN AS 705.-11 CUMMINGS
STREET, 42-58% EAST AVENUE, T05-11 RIVER STREET, AND
4O EAST AVENUE AND 704-06 CUMMINGS STREET; IN THE CITY
OF AUSTIN, TRAVIS COUNTY, TEXAS; ORDERING A CHANGE IN
THE USE MAPS SO AS TO RECORD THE CHANGE HEREBY ORDERED;
AND SUSPENDING THE RULE REQUIRING THE READING OF ORDI-
NANCES ON THREE BEPARATE DAYS,

The ordinance was read the first time and Councilman White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its second reading. The
moticn, seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Iong, Palmer, Pearson,'White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

The ordinance was read the second time and Councilman White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its third reading. The
motion, seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried by the following vote:

Ayes:- Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: HNone

The ordinance was read the third time and Councilmen White moved that
the ordinsnce be finally passed. The motion, seconded by Councilman Pearsdm,
carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Mijller
Noes: None

The Mayor announced that the ordinsnce had been finally passed.

Counellman Palmer offered the following resolution and moved its adoptions

( RESOLUTION)

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Austin, & municipal
corporation of the State of Texas, that W. T. Williams, Jr., said corporation!s
City Manager, be and he is hereby duly authorized and fully empowered to enter
into and execute, for and in the name of said corporation, one certain written
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agreement, dated November 9, 1955, effective October 2k, 1955, between said
corporation and Guy A,Thompson, Trustee, International-Great Northern Railroad
Company, Debtor, herein called Carrier, regpecting among certain things the
construction, ownership, maintenance, and use of one certsin 12-inch sewer line
erossing Carrier's Premises at Engineer's Chaining Station 9207 } 26, at or
near Hooper (4. C. Siding), Travis County, Texas, all as more particularly set
out in said agreement, to which reference is made the same as if fully set out

herein,

The motion, seconded by Councilman White, carried by the following vote:
Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

Councilman Long offered the following resolution and moved its adoption:

( RESOLUTION)

_ WHEREAS, bids were received by the City of Austin on November 1k, 1955,
for the furnishing of 240 - k5-foot poles and 55 - 60 to 75 foot poles; and,

WHEREAS, the total bid of Wm. Somerville Co. in the sum of $14%,137.00
for the furnishing of both types of poles was the lowest and best bid therefor,
and the acceptance of such total bld has been recommended by the Purchasing
Agent of the City of Austin, and by the City Manager; Now, Therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

That the total bid of Wm. Somerville Co. in the sum of $1%,137.00 be and
the same iz hereby accepted, and W. T. Williams, Jr., City Manager of the City
of Austin i1s hereby euthorized and directed to execute a contract on behalf of
the City of Austin with Wm, Somerville Co.

The motion, seconded by Councilman Pearson, carried by the following vote:
Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: HNone

Councilman Palmer offered the following resolution and moved its adoption:

(RESOLUTTION)

WHEREAS, bids were recelved by the City of Austin on November 10, 1955,
for the purchase of five (5) one-ton pick-up truck chassis for line trucks for
use by the Electric Department; and,

WHEREAS, the bid of C., B. Smith Motors in the sum of $5,867.45 was the ..
lowest and best bid therefor, and the acceptance of such bid has been recommended
by the Purchasing Agent of the City of Austin, and by the City Mesnager; Now,
Therefore,/ ‘ )

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

That the bid of C. B. Smith Motors in the sum of $5,867.45 be and the
same is hereby accepted, and W. T, Williams, Jr., Clty Manager of the City of
Austin is hereby asuthorized and directed to execute a contract on behalf of the
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City of Austin with C. B. Smith Motors.

The City Manager was requested to check and see if the 1952 truck, that
was listed to be traded in, could be used by any of the Departments of the City
and if it weré more advantageous for the City to keep this truck then add the
$350 offered by C. B. Smith Mbtors to the contract if it were agreeable to them.

The'motion, seconded by Councilmen Long, carried by the following vote:
Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noesg: None

Councilman White offered the following resolution and moved its adoption:
( RESOLUTION)

WHEREAS, bids were requested by the City of Austin on October 21, 1955,
for the purchase of 40,000 pounds of sodium hexametaphosphate in 100-pound,
mlti-wall, water~procf paper bags, in carload lots, for use in the Water Filter
Plant; and,

WHEREAS, the only bid received was that of Maintenance Engineering Com-
pany in the sum of $5,648.00 per 40,000-pound car; and,

WHEREAS, by purchasing sodium hexametaphosphate in carload lots, the
City of Austin can save $361.00 per car over purchasing in truck shipments as
the City hes done in the past; and,

WHEREAS, the City of Austin now has a&dequate siorage space for carload
lots; and,

WHEREAS, the acceptance of such bid has been recommended by thelSuperin-
tendent of the Water and Sewage Treatment Pepartment of the City of Austin and
by the City Manskger; Now, Therefore,

BE IT RESCOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

That the bid of Meintenance Engineering Company in the sum of $5,648.00
per 40,000-pound car, be and the same is hereby sccepted, and W, T, Willisms,
Jre., Clty Manager of the City of Austin, is hereby authorized and directed to
execute a contract on behalf of the City of Austin with Meintenance Engineering

Company.
The motion, seconded by Councilman Palmer, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None :

The City Manager submitied the following:

"PABULATION OF BIDS ON PACKAGE TYPE WATER TUBE STEAM BOILER
FOR MUNICIPAL ABATTOIR

"BIDDER 20,000 pound rating 18,000 pound reting 15,000 pound
rating

"Cnggfstion Engineering, $26,799.00 $25,975.00 ghg’m.oo
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"A. M. Lockett & Co. $30, 434,00 $26,702,00 $24,153.00
"Poster Wheeler Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid
r".Zl'ohnscn_'x-}le;yck Inec. No Bid - No Bid " No Bid

"Having only an appropriation of $25,000.00 for Capital Expenditures in our pre-
sent budget, we must purchase the 15,000 pound rated boller and we preferc the
Combustion Engineering boiler st the low bid of $2h 075.00.

"Respectfully submitted
8/ Eldred Perry
Eldred Perry, Supt.
Municipal Abattoir
"Approved:
8/ D. C. Kinney"

Councilman White offered the following resoclution and moved its adopbion:
( RESOLUTION)

WHEREAS, bids were received by the City of Austin on October 20, 1955,
for the purchase of & package-type water tube steam boller for the Municipal
Abattoir; and,

WHEREAS, the bid of Combustion Engineering, Incorporated, in the sum of
$24,095.00 for the said boiler was the lowest and best bid therefor, and the
acceptance of such bld has been recommended by the Superintendent of the Eleciric
Department of the City of Austin, and by the City Manager; Now, Therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

That the bid of Combustion Englneering, Incorporated, in the sum of
$24,075.00 be and the same is hereby accepted, and W, T. Williems, Jr., City
Manager of the City of Austin is hereby authorized and directed to execute a
contract on behalf of the City of Austin with Combustion Engineering, Incor-
porated,

The Glty.Maneger wes also suthorized to purchase the 18,000 pound rating
boiler instead of the 15,000 if there was a need for a larger boiler, at an
additional cost of $1,900.

The motion, seconded by Councilman Long, carried by the following vote:
Ayes: Councilmen Long, Pdlmer, Pearsdn, White, Mayor Miller
Neoes: DNone

Mayor Miller introduced the following ordinance:

AN ORDINANCE PERPETUALLY VACATING AND CLOSING

A CERTATIN PORTION OF WHITE HORSE TRAIL WHICH LIES
WEST OF BURNET ROAD, IN THE CITY OF AUSTIN, TRAVIS
COUNTY, TEXAS; AND SUSPENDING THE ORDINANCE RULE
REQUIRING THE READING OF AN ORDINANCE ON THREE
SEPARATE DAYS.
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The ordinance was read the first time and Councilman White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinsance passed to its second reading. The
motion, seconded by Councilmsn Pearson, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Hoes: None

The ordinance was read the second time and Councilmsn White mowved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its third reading, The
motion, seconded by Councilmen Pearson, carried by the following vote:

Ayeg: Councilmen ILong, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

The ordinance was read the third {ime and Councilmen White moved that
the ordinence be finally passed. The motion, seconded by Councilman Pearson,

carried by the foldowing vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: DNome

The Mayor announced that the ordinance had been finally passed,

Mayor Miller introduced the following ordinence:

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE GITY COUNCIL OF THE
CITY OF AUSTIN, ACTING FOR AND IN BEHALF OF SATD
CITY, TC ENTER INTO ALL NECESSARY AGREFMENTS WITH
THE STATE DEPARIMENT OF PUBLIC WELFARE REIATIVE
T0 FEDERAL OLD-AGE AND SURVIVORS INSURANCE BENEFITS

- UNDER THE PROVISIONS OF APPLICABLE STATE AND FEDERAL
IAWS; AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO EXECUTE ALL SAID
NECESSARY AGREEMENTS AND INSTRUMENTS FOR AND ON BEHALF
OF SAID CITY COUNCIL AND CITY; DIRECTING THE DIRECTOR
OF FINANCE TO MAKE ASSESSMENTS, COLLECTIONS AND REPORTS;
AND ORDERING THE ALLOCATION AND SETTING ASIDE OF SUF-
FICIENT MONEY FROM AVAITABLE FUNDS TO CARRY OUT THE
PROVISIONS OF SAID IAWS, SUCH MONEY TO EE SET ASIDE AND
MAINTAINED IN THE REGUIAR CITY DEPOSITORY AND TO BE KNOWN
AS THE CITY OF AUSTIN SOCIAL SECURITY FUND; AND DECLARING

AN EMERGENCY.

The ordinance was read the first time and Councilmen White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance passed to its second reading. The
motion, seconded by Councilman Long, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Meyor Miller
Noes: None

The ordinance was read the second time and Councilmen White moved that
the rule be suspended and the ordinance pamgsed to its third reading, The
motion, seconded by Councilman Long, carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None
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The ordinance was read the third time and Councilmen White moved that
the ordinance be finally passed. The motion, seconded by Councilman Long, o
carried by the following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

The Meyor announced that the ordinance had been finally passed.

The Council set the pay period beginning November 25, 1955 as the ef-
fective date, Councilman Long stated she thought this was a great milestone
for the city employees and a millstone Ffor the City. The Mayor stated he
hoped this would encourege the employees to give a better days work and he
stresséd courisey for all employees. The Council digcussed the city pension
and the City Manager stated the study by the Actuary wes expected by the first
of the year. '

Councilman Long moved that the Council send to the Planning Commission
an ordinence vacating and closing portion of Perry lane which lies east of Bull
Creek Road and west of Finley Drive, for review and recommendation. The motion,
seconded by Councilmen Palmer, carried by the following vote: -

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

Councilman Long offered the following resolution and moved its adoption:
( RESOLUTION)
BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

THAT the City Council of the City of Austin hereby approves the property
situated on the north side of East Sixth Street as a private gasoline plant
consisting of a One thousand gallon tank and electric pump for the sole purpose
of servicing their own motor equipment, and from which no gasoline is to be
80ld, which property 1ls leased by Longhorn Sash & Door Company, and is part of
Iot 2, Outlot 9, Division A, of the H & T.C Addition in the City of Austin,
Travis County, Texes, and hereby authorizes the said Longhorn S8ash & Door Com-
pany to operate a private gasoline plant consisting of & one thousand gallon
tenk and electric pump for the sole purpose of servicing their own motor equip-
ment, and from which no gesoline is to be sold, subject to the same being operat-
ed in compliance with all the ordinances relsting thereto, and further subject
to the foregoing attached recommendations; and the Building Inspector is hereby
authorized to issue an occupancy permit for the operation of this private gaso-
line plant after full compliance with all the provisions of this resolution,
and sald permission shall be held to be granted, and accepted subject to all
necessary reasonable and proper, present and future regulations and ordinances
of the Clty of Austin, Texas, in the enforcement of the proper police, traffiec
and fire regulations; and the right of revocation is retained if, after hearing,
it is found by the Cily Council that the said Longhorn Sash and Door Company
has feiled and refused, and will continue to fail and refuse to perform any
such conditions, regulations and ordinances.
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(Reédommendations Attached)

"Austin, Texas
Novembexr 17, 1955

"Mr., W. T, Williams
City Manager
Austin, Texes

"Dear Sir:

"I, the undersigned, heve comsidered the applicetion of Longhorn Sash & Door
Compeny, through their agent Billy McElroy for permission to operate a private
gaseline plent comgisting of & one thousand gallon underground tank and pump
for the sole purpose of servicing their own motor equipment and from which no
geseline 1s to be sold, upon property located on the morth side of East Sixth
Street, which property is designated as part of Lot 2, Outlot 9, Division 4,
of the H & T C Addition, in the City of Austin, TraV1s County, Texas, and
locelly known as 2200 East Sixth Street.

"This property is located in an "E" Beavy Inmdustrial District and I recommend
that this permit be granted subject to the following conditions:

"(1) That the gmsoline tanks and pumps shall be of en approved type and shall

bear the label of the Underwriters Iaberetories, Inc., and that all tanks and'

pumps shall be installed in compliance with the Ordinence gowerning the storage
and handling of gesoline.

"(2) 'That all tanks and pumps shall be located not nearer than 10 feet to the
property line and so located that cars stopped for the purpose of unloading
or receiving gasoline or other supplies shall not in any way obstruct the free
passage of traffic on either the sidewalk, street or alley.

"(3) That "NO SMOKING" sigus shell at all times be prominently Qisplayed and
no person shall be permitted to smocke om the premises where gasoline is handled
or stored.

"(4) Thet 21l fees shall be paid and a permit secured from the Building In-
spector's Office before any Installation work is started, and that no equipment
- shall be placed in operation until after fingl inspection and approval of same.

"Respectfully submitted,
(8gd) J. C. Fckert
Je. C. Eckert
Building Inspector"
The motion, seconded by Councilman Pearson, cerried by the following vote:
Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: DNone
Councilman Long offered the following resolution and moved its adoption:
{ RESOLUTION)

WHEREAS, the City of Austin executed a lease to all of Lots 2, 3 and b
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of James Byrnes Subdivision in Austin, Texas, to the Austin Council for Re-
tarded Children by instrument dated February 1, 195L; and,

WHEREAS, pursuagnt to such lease & frame building was placed upon such
property for use by the said Austin Couneil for Retarded Children and is now
known as 915 West 284 Street; and,

WHEREAS, by Parsgraph Six of the said lease, lessee should have the
right to make alterations and additions to sueh structure provided such altera-
tion or addition be first approved in writing by lessor; and,

WHEREAS, the Austin Council for Retarded Children has requested, in
writing, permission to make certain alterations and additions to such structure;
Now, Therefore,

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF AUSTIN:

That, subject to exlsting regulations as to building permits, and pro-
vided that the applicable zoning regulations as to setback and side yard spac-
ing are observed, the Austin Council for Retarded Children be and it is hereby
granted permission' to -meke the following alterationsg and additions to the
building at 915 West 28% Street:

1. Add an additional room on the west side of the building, approximatel;
It x 257;

2. Meke minor interior alterations at & cost not to exceed $3,200.00.

The motion, seconded by Counciiman Palmer, carried by the following
vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Long, Palmer, Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: None

The Council had before it the following letter:

"A. H. Edburg, Jr..
1217 Lynn Avenue
Midiend, Texas

"Novewber 14, 1955

"Members of the Council
City of Austin,
Texas

"Dear Madam and Sirs:

"You will recall at the Thursday, October 20, 1955, City Council«Meeting, I
made a personal appearance to request that consideration be given for relocating
of an existing electrical power line and power pole that passes throught the
Lagune Vista subdivision. The conclusion reached at this meeting was that the
Counecil would consider my proposal, which is attached, for reletating this
faeility.




m!zli?’?_ﬂ

CITY OF AUSTIN, TEXAS

"It should be mentioned that immediately following my appearance before the
Council, I Joined with members of the City of Austin's engineering staff,
Messrs. D. C. Kinney, D. A. Conrad, and H. A, Tankersley for the purpose of
going to the site of the power line in laguna Viste, :

"After studying the terrain and waking notes, we returned, and the engineering
department designed an alternate route similar to the one submitted herewith.
Mr. Tankersley &dvised me later that the total cost would be approximately
$2,200,00,

"The advantages of the proposed routing of the power line over the existing
line are as follows:

"l. It observes the property lines &g recognized in the eese-
ment that the City of Austin has used for justifying the
present line's location.

"2. It preserves the.principle set forth by the City of Austin
for not dividing surveyed lots into smaller segments with
power lines and the like.

"3. It mainteins the customary practice of placing high voltage
lines over roadways or alleyways. In this case, the 69,000
volt line follows the roadway, laguna Vista Drive.

"h, It regtores the value of Lots 7 through 14 inclusive. Con-
servative bank valuations for Lots 7, 8 and 9 are $1,000
per lot. If we apply this valuation to the wemaining lots,
ve total $8,000 minimum, a value that can be returned to
the property owners. By comparing the real cost of the
exlsting power line, $10,000 (estimated cost to the City of
Austin $2,000 and estimated cost to the property owners
$8,000) as against the cost of $2,200 for the proposed route,
we have a saving of $7,800 to those concerned.

"S. It permits the use of building sites that are presently either
destroyed or limited.

"In closing, I wish to express my sincere thanks to the Members of the City
Council and the City of Austin's engineering staff for their attentiveness to
my request.

"Yours very truly,
- ment” A+ H, Edburg, Jr."
Lt tadhmen

The Council agreed if the property owners put up the $2,200 the city
would go ahead,

The Mayor stated that it was the intention of the City to pick up all
dogs on the streets after the lst of January, either with tags or without.
The people in charge of the pound to be notified of this and be prepared to
care for them. The City Manager was reguested to have estimates prepared of
the cost of caring for the dogs at the present city dog pound. The Mayor
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suggested that if a dog is picked up that has a tag, that the owner be notified.
He also suggested if a dog was run over &nd the city picked it up that the tag
and collar he sent to the owner.

Mr, L. W. Moody, 1302 South 6th Street, reguested stop signs be in-
stalled on South 5th Street at Gibson Street; a street light at South 6th and
Gibson; storm sewer and paving. The Council referred the request for stop
signs to the Traffic Engineer.

The Mayor reviewed the present contract with the Gas Company for fur-
nishing gas for the power plant and the proposed contract had been discussed.
The Gas Company was asked to have their attorneys present their proposal in
writing to the City Manager and City Attorney. Tt will be studied and an
ansver given within a reasonable time., The Mayor stated if any other Gas
Companies were interested in furnishing the City gas at a fixed price, the
City was open.

Councilman White moved that the City Attorney be instructed to prepare
an ordinagnce setting up an increase Iin gas rates for domestic, commercial and’
industrial users. The motion, seconded by Councilman Palmer, carried by the
following vote:

Ayes: Councilmen Palmer; Pearson, White, Mayor Miller
Noes: Councilman Long

This is & 15 or 16% increase requested by the Gas Company. Councilman
Long voted against the motion with the statement that she did not think the
increase was Jjustified, that the increase was too high, and the Council had not
had the opinion of a rate expert.. The Mayor stated the cost of doing business
was higher and he thought 1t would have been a waste of the taxpayers money
to hire an expéet.

The Councill asked that they be sent copies of the Base Ball Contzact
and it would be considered next week,

Councilmen Long inguired about a traffic light being installed at
Koenig lane and Woodrow., BShe read two letters requesting that something be
done at this intersection.

The Council joined Councilman White in commending the employees &t the
Power Plant for working so diligently during a break in a main at the power
plant and keeping the water out of the plant.

The Council discussed the development of & park in the vicinity of the
Interregional Highway Bridge. It was suggested that the City confer with the
State and Parks and Recreation Board and see if they would be interested in
placing picnic tables and barbecus pits there. Councilman Pearson inquired
about the houses that were kept by the City to be placed at this location.
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Mayor Miller inqulred about the plans for widening the Congress Avenue
Bridge; he asked that this matter be expedited.

The City Manager presented the metter of a lady paying for a water tap
on Meadows Street and she wanted to transfer this deposit over to the next
street hecause Meadows Street does not have a line., It was suggested that she
leave her deposit and make another one on the other street and also get an
easement. The City Manager was to write her.

There being no further business, the Council adjourned at 12:35 P.M.,

subject to the call of the Mayor.
APPROVED N\ILA_Q_Q Q.

Mayor

ATTEST:

7lace PPosmrae

‘Deputy City Clerk




