
City of Austin | Austin Fire  December 19, 2025 

  

 

 

 

The ignition-resistant (IR) construction requirements in the 2024 International Wildland-Urban Interface Code 
(IWUIC) are based on how close a building or structure is to wildland areas. The amended IWUIC divides 
these areas into three proximity zones: 
 

Section 504 – WUI Proximity Zone A 
Section 505 – WUI Proximity Zone B 
Section 506 – WUI Proximity Zone C 

 
The abbreviation "WUIC" refers to both the code and local amendments together. The following summary 
highlights key requirements from WUIC Chapter 5. However, all other chapters and adopted appendices of the 
Wildland-Urban Interface Code and the Fire Code also apply, regardless of a building’s proximity zone. This 
summary does not cover every possible requirement. 
 
For plan review, staff will not accept documents that simply copy code language or information from this guide. 
Code references must be specific to the project, and construction drawings must clearly show how the design 
meets IWUIC standards (for example, through floor plans, elevations, and wall sections).  
 
Construction documents must list exact material types and product details, including manufacturer and model 
numbers (such as Acme Composition Shingle Roof #1234 Pinnacle Collection, Class A per ASTM E 108), so 
compliance can be verified during review. Materials subject to WUIC requirements must be specified in 
advance; on-site material selection is not allowed. 
 

The code and amendments can be located here: 
https://www.austintexas.gov/department/wildland-urban-interface-code 

 
All WUI Proximity Zones must comply with these sections: 

- WUIC Chapter 4 [Amended] Access and Water Supply 
- 2024 IFC Chapter 5 [Amended] and Appendix B [Amended] 
- WUIC 507.1 [Amended] Roof repair or replacement 
- WUIC 603.2.1 [Amended] Ember Ignition Zone (EIZ) 
- IWUIC 605 Spark arresters 
- IWUIC A104.5 Generators and other similar ignition sources 
- IWUIC A104.7 and A104.8 Outdoor fires, barbecues, grills, outdoor fireplaces 

  

Guide to 2024 WUIC Proximity Zones 
Ignition-Resistant Construction 

AustinTexas.gov/Fire 
Phone: 512-974-0160, Option 3 
Email: wuicodeinfo@austintexas.gov  

 

 

https://www.austintexas.gov/department/wildland-urban-interface-code
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-4-wildland-urban-interface-area-requirements
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IFC2024V1.0/chapter-5-fire-service-features#IFC2024V1.0_Pt03_Ch05
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IFC2024V1.0/appendix-b-fire-flow-requirements-for-buildings#IFC2024V1.0_Pt07_AppxB
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-6-fire-protection-requirements#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch06_Sec605
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/appendix-a-general-requirements#IWUIC2024V2.0_AppxA_SecA104.5
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/appendix-a-general-requirements#IWUIC2024V2.0_AppxA_SecA104.7
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/appendix-a-general-requirements#IWUIC2024V2.0_AppxA_SecA104.8
mailto:wuicodeinfo@austintexas.gov


City of Austin | Austin Fire  December 19, 2025 

WUI Proximity Zone A:  
Structures located 50 feet or closer to the wildland  
 
WUI Proximity Zone A Construction will meet the following basic requirements (see amendments and code for 
full requirements) 
 

- WUIC 503.2 [Amended] Ignition-resistant building material, 30-minute test required 
- WUIC 504.2 Class A roof covering and assemblies  

o WUIC 504.2.1 & 504.2.1.1 [Amended] Roof valleys / Woven roof valleys  
o WUIC 504.2.2.2 [Amended] & WUIC 504.8 Skylights  
o See additional Amended items under section 504.2 subsections 

- WUIC 504.3 [Amended] Protection of eaves 
o WUIC 504.10.3 [Amended] Soffit vents are not allowed 
o WUIC 504.3.4 [Amended] Exposed rafter tails 
o WUIC 504.3.5 [Amended] Exterior ceilings 
o See additional Amended items under section 504.3 subsections 

- WUIC 504.4 [Amended] Gutters & downspouts with leaf guards 
- WUIC 504.5 Exterior walls  
- WUIC 504.5.1 Flashing 
- WUIC 504.6 & 504.7.1 [Amended] Underfloor enclosure includes 10% slope requirements 
- WUIC 504.7 [Amended] Unenclosed appendages, projections, and structures  

o WUIC 504.7.2 [Amended] Fence structures located within 10 feet of a building or structure  
o For minimum solid heavy timber size refer to the 2024 International Building Code (IBC) Table 

2304.11 
- WUIC 504.8 Exterior glazing 
- WUIC 504.9 Exterior doors  
- WUIC 504.10 [Amended] Vents  
- WUIC 504.11.2 [Amended] Boat Docks 

 
 
  

https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec503.2
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.2
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.2.1
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.8
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.5
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.5.1
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.6
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IBC2024V1.0/chapter-23-wood#IBC2024V1.0_Ch23_Sec2304.11_Tbl2304.11
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IBC2024V1.0/chapter-23-wood#IBC2024V1.0_Ch23_Sec2304.11_Tbl2304.11
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.8
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.8
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.10
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971


City of Austin | Austin Fire  December 19, 2025 

WUI Proximity Zone B:  
Structures located greater than 50 feet and up to 150 feet from the wildland  
 
WUI Proximity Zone B Construction will meet the following basic requirements (see amendments and code for 
full requirements); WUI Proximity Zone A materials are also allowed. 
 

- WUIC 503.2 [Amended] Ignition-resistant building material, exception allowing 10-minute test  
- WUIC 505.2 Class A roof covering and assemblies  

o WUIC 505.2.1 & 505.2.1.1 [Amended] Roof valleys / Woven roof valleys 
o WUIC 505.2.2.2 [Amended] & WUIC 505.8 [Amended] Skylights  
o See additional Amended items under section 505.2 subsections 

- WUIC 505.3 [Amended] Protection of eaves 
o WUIC 505.10.3 [Amended] Soffit vents are not allowed 
o WUIC 505.3.4 [Amended] Exposed rafter tails  
o WUIC 505.3.5 [Amended] Exterior ceilings 
o See additional Amended items under section 505.3 subsections 

- WUIC 505.4 [Amended] Gutters & downspouts with leaf guards 
- WUIC 505.5 Exterior walls 
- WUIC 505.6 & 505.7.1 [Amended] Underfloor enclosure includes 10% slope requirements 
- WUIC 505.7 [Amended] Unenclosed appendages, projections, and structures within 30 feet of a 

building with habitable or occupiable space 
o WUIC 505.7.2 [Amended] Fence structures located within 10 feet of a building or structure  
o For minimum solid heavy timber size refer to the 2024 International Building Code (IBC) Table 

2304.11 
- WUIC 505.10 [Amended] Vents 
- WUIC 505.11.2 [Amended] Boat Docks 

 
  

https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec503.2
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec505.2
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec505.2.1
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec504.5
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec505.6
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IBC2024V1.0/chapter-23-wood#IBC2024V1.0_Ch23_Sec2304.11_Tbl2304.11
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IBC2024V1.0/chapter-23-wood#IBC2024V1.0_Ch23_Sec2304.11_Tbl2304.11
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec505.10
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971


City of Austin | Austin Fire  December 19, 2025 

WUI Proximity Zone C:  
Structures located  

• greater than 150 feet out to 1.5 miles from 750 acres or larger wildland, or 
• greater than 150 feet out to 0.5 miles from 40 acres or larger wildland 

 
WUI Proximity Zone C Construction will meet the following basic requirements (see amendments and code for 
full requirements); WUI Proximity Zone A and B materials are also allowed. 
 

- WUIC 503.2 [Amended] Ignition-resistant building material, exception allowing 10-minute test  
- WUIC 506.2 [Amended] Class A roof covering and assemblies  

o WUIC 506.2.1 & WUIC 506.2.1.1 [Amended] Roof valleys / Woven roof valleys 
o WUIC 506.2.2.2 [Amended] & WUIC 506.7 [Amended] Skylights  
o See additional Amended items under section 506.2 subsections 

- WUIC 506.3 & 506.8.1 [Amended] Underfloor enclosure 
- WUIC 506.4 [Amended] Protection of eaves 

o WUIC 506.4.4 [Amended] Exposed rafter tails 
o WUIC 506.4.5 [Amended] Exterior ceilings 
o WUIC 506.4.6 [Amended] Gutters & downspouts with leaf guards 
o See additional Amended items under section 506.4 subsections 

- WUIC 506.5 [Amended] Vents  
- WUIC 506.6 [Amended] Unenclosed appendages, projections, and structures within 10 feet of a 

building with habitable or occupiable space  
o WUIC 506.6.1 [Amended] Fences located within 10 feet of a building or structure. 

 Exception: within 5 feet of Residential Code building or structure 
o For minimum solid heavy timber size refer to the 2024 International Building Code (IBC) Table 

2304.11 
- WUIC 506.8.2 [Amended] Boat Docks 

 

 

https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec503.2
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec506.2.1
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IWUIC2024V2.0/chapter-5-special-building-construction-regulations#IWUIC2024V2.0_Ch05_Sec506.3
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IBC2024V1.0/chapter-23-wood#IBC2024V1.0_Ch23_Sec2304.11_Tbl2304.11
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IBC2024V1.0/chapter-23-wood#IBC2024V1.0_Ch23_Sec2304.11_Tbl2304.11
https://services.austintexas.gov/edims/document.cfm?id=451971

